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About the Webinar
Conference Series LLC Ltd is delighted to invite Scientists, 
Physiotherapists, neurologists, Doctors, researchers and experts 
from the arena of Addiction and Drug Abuse, to attend a Webinar 
on Addiction and Drug Abuse on July 26, 2021. Webinar on 
Addiction is a specially designed cluster webinar that consists 
of keynote presentations, Oral talks, Poster presentations, Panel 
Discussions and Exhibitions, Young Researcher Forums (YRF), 
Best Poster Award, Industry academic interactive sessions, and 
Industry Presentations, etc.

This Webinar on Addiction Conference is based on the theme 
“Exploring Latest Innovations in Addiction and Drug 
Abuse”. Webinar on Addiction welcomes proposals and 
ideas from both Industry & Academia to be presented on this 
interactive platform.

Why attend?
Webinar on Addiction aims to bring together leading academic 

scientists, researchers, and research scholars to exchange and 
share their experiences and research results on all aspects of 
Drug Addiction. It also provides a premier interdisciplinary 
platform for researchers, practitioners, and educators to present 
and discuss the most recent innovations, trends, and concerns as 
well as practical challenges encountered and solutions adopted 
in the fields of Drug addiction and rehabilitation. We welcome 
all interested participants to join us for our conference on 
Webinar on Addiction and Drug Abuse.
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