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Introduction 

Tobacco consumption in various forms, including 
smoking and chewing, significantly increases the risk 
of oropharyngeal cancer. Likewise, excessive alcohol 
intake, especially when combined with tobacco use, 
escalates this risk substantially [1]. 

Infection with certain strains of HPV, notably HPV- 
16, has emerged as a prominent risk factor for 
oropharyngeal cancer. Engaging in behaviors that 
increase the risk of contracting HPV, such as 
unprotected oral sex, elevates the likelihood of 
developing this cancer[2]. 

Oropharyngeal cancer is more prevalent in older 
individuals, particularly those over 55. Moreover, 
men are at a higher risk compared to women, 
although the gap is narrowing due to the increased 
incidence of HPV-related cancers [3]. 

Chronic poor oral hygiene and certain oral health 
conditions have been associated with a higher risk of 
oropharyngeal cancer. Regular dental check-ups and 
maintaininggoodoral health practices are essential [4]. 

Avoiding or quitting tobacco use and limiting 
alcohol consumption significantly lowers the risk of 
developing oropharyngeal cancer. Support programs 
and resources are available to aid in smoking 
cessation and reducing alcohol intake [5]. 

Vaccination against HPV, ideally administered before 
engaging in sexual activity, is an effective preventive 
strategy. Vaccination can significantly reduce the 
risk of HPV-related oropharyngeal cancer [6]. 

Practicing safe sex, including the use of barrier 
methods like condoms during oral sex, reduces the 
risk of HPV transmission and subsequently lowers 
the risk of oropharyngeal cancer [7]. 

Maintaining a healthy diet rich in fruits and 
vegetables while minimizing processed foods 
and high-fat content can contribute to overall 
health and potentially lower the risk of developing 
oropharyngeal cancer [8]. 

Routine medical check-ups, especially oral 
examinations, play a crucial role in early detection 
and prevention. Prompt identification of suspicious 
lesions or changes in the mouth can lead to early 
intervention and improved outcomes [9]. 

Among the primary risk factors for oropharyngeal 
cancer are tobacco and excessive alcohol 
consumption. Long-term use of tobacco in various 
forms, including smoking and smokeless tobacco, 
along with heavy alcohol intake, significantly 
increases the risk of developing this type of cancer 
[10]. 

Conclusion 

Awareness of the risk factors associated with 
oropharyngeal cancer and the adoption of 
preventive strategies are paramount in reducing 
its incidence. Addressing lifestyle choices, ensuring 
HPV vaccination, maintaining good oral hygiene, 
and regular health check-ups contribute significantly 
to lowering the risk and potentially preventing the 
onset of oropharyngeal cancer. By integrating these 
preventive measures into daily life, individuals 
can take proactive steps towards reducing their 
susceptibility to this type of cancer and promoting 
overall well-being. 
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