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Post-operative care is management of patients after any 
surgery. The main goal of post-operative care is to pre-

vent complications i.e. atelectasis and infection. The other 
objective is early healing of the surgical incision and return 
of patient to a state of health. About 17% to 88% of people 
in postoperative duration will have decreased lung volumes. 
This decreased lung volume problem can be solved with the 
use of incentive spirometry in the postoperative period on 
Day 1. Incentive spirometer is perioperative respiratory ther-
apy given to postoperative patients to improve lung volume 
of patients and hasten recovery of patients also. The main 
aim of study was to identify effect of Incentive spirometry on 
postoperative patient’s recovery. It was a pre-experimental 
study with pre-test-posttest design only, which was done on 
post-operative patients at All India Institute of Medical Sci-
ences, Rishikesh. Data collection tools consist of two parts. 
Part I consists of socio-demographic variable including age, 
gender, and diagnosis. Part II consist of observation checklist 
in which patients were observed when they were doing in-
centive spirometry (Take 15 breaths with spirometer in every 
2 hours) on Day 1, 2 and 3 and check their performance level 
i.e. score=0, not able to perform, score=1 means inadequate, 
score=2 means moderately adequate and score=3 mean-
ing adequate performance. Data analysis was done using 
descriptive statistics and inferential statistics. For socio-de-
mographic data frequency and percentage were calculated. 
Chi square test was used to find relationship of socio-demo-
graphic variables with pre-test and post-test results. t test 
was applied to identify difference between pre-test and post 
test results. Majority (52 %) of participants were 41 to 50 
years age group. The male and female ratio for participants 
was 46:54. paired ‘t’ test p value i.e. 0.00* with CI [0.72, 

1.03] showed that on pretest and Day 3 performance level 
on incentive spirometry of participants showed a significant 
value, which indicated that spirometer enhanced recovery 
of post-operative patients by increasing their lung volumes. 
This study revealed that incentive spirometry is effective in 
improving pulmonary function among post-operative pa-
tients, which further improves blood circulation and hasten 
early recovery of surgical wound. This spirometry should be 
an integral part of post-operative care. All nurses who are in-
volved in postoperative units should encourage patients to 
do it on a regular basis and document it as a vital sign.
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