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OVER THE COUNTRY
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Since a few decades, the population of the Democratic Republic of the Con-
go lives a sustainable poisoning fear all over the country. The reason is the 

existence through the country of an odd health phenomenon characterized by 
numerous extra-digestive pathologies unable to be diagnosed and looked af-
ter by the national health system. In 1990, Our Laboratory of Toxicology start-
ed a research work of the phenomenon in concern. In 2010, after 20 years 
of trying, we established surprisingly an unexpected link with Helicobacter 
pylori infection. Normally, Helicobacter pylori pathologies concern quite spe-
cifically the digestive tube. Recent literature however reports more and more 
extra-digestive symptoms linked to Helicobacter pylori, but the passage of 
Helicobacter pylori toxins to blood stream was not specified. Our research 
work appears as a response to the international scientific community query. 
Indeed, we established that Helicobacter pylori toxins released in stomach by 
the reaction urea-urease linked to Helicobacter pylori, are in gaseous state. 
After their release, they are normally excreted in stools but, in case of consti-
pation, instead of going down, they fly up along the esophagus, get the larynx 
way and reach the lungs. From there, they enter then into blood circulating 
system. The massive passage of Helicobacter pylori toxins in blood signs an 
ammonia and carbon dioxide double intoxication. Our results have been pre-
sented in international conferences throughout the world and relevant publi-
cations have been made in international journals. Two case reports are also 
exposed. In conclusion, Helicobacter pylori involves a strong toxic-infection 
unknown in literature so far, instead of a simple infection, consecutively, ex-
tra-digestive pathologies reported in recent literature are easily understood 
and the treatment changes to take in count the toxic component.
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