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Abstract:
The Mediterranean Diet (MD) is meant as one of the 
healthiest eating pattern. The concept of MD was first 
coined by Ancel keys, an American physician. Ancel Keys 
and co-workers in the 1950s were the first to establish 
the link between MD and health by showing an inverse 
correlation between adherence to the MD and the inci-
dence of coronary heart disease. The MD was observed 
in southern Europe after World War II (1).

MD key nutritional features (quality and quantity of 
food) should necessarily be considered together with the 
role of food in history and culture of the Mediterranean 
regions where conviviality, traditions and lifestyle are in-
tegral part of the relationship with food.                                                  

MD was included in 2013 in the list of intangible Cultur-
al Heritage of the World by UNESCO that gives a broad-
er definition of the MD as: fi a set of skills, knowledge, 
rituals, symbols and traditions concerning crops, harvest-
ing, fishing, animal husbandry, conservation, processing, 
cooking, and particularly the sharing and consumption 
of food fi (2).

Along the decays the healthiness of a MD pattern char-
acterized by high consumption of vegetables, fruits, le-
gumes, and grains; moderate consumption of milk and 
dairy products, low consumption of meat and meat prod-
ucts (2) and high consumption of extra virgin olive oil as 
main fat has been confirmed by multiple scientific pa-
pers.

This dietary pattern is useful in the prevention of a num-
ber of non-communicable diseases and still today the ma-
jority of nutritional guidelines worldwide are based on its 
structure. Despite the several trendy diets studied along 
the decays, a balanced MD can also be of help in weight 
loss (4).  
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