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Introduction
Neonatal respiratory distress syndrome (NRDS), also known 
as hyaline membrane disease, is a common and potentially 
life-threatening condition affecting premature infants. It arises 
due to surfactant deficiency in the immature lungs, leading 
to respiratory insufficiency and hypoxemia shortly after birth. 
Despite advances in neonatal care, NRDS remains a significant 
cause of morbidity and mortality in preterm infants, presenting 
various challenges in its management [1].

The introduction of antenatal corticosteroids and exogenous 
surfactant therapy revolutionized the management of NRDS, 
significantly reducing its incidence and improving outcomes. 
However, challenges persist in optimizing the care of preterm 
infants affected by NRDS, particularly in the context of 
increasing survival rates of extremely premature infants 
and the potential long-term consequences of NRDS and its 
treatment [2].

This review aims to explore the current challenges faced in 
the management of NRDS and highlight recent advances in 
therapeutic strategies. By examining the evolving landscape 
of NRDS management, including the use of novel surfactant 
preparations, respiratory support techniques, and adjunctive 
therapies, we can gain insights into improving outcomes and 
minimizing complications in affected neonates [3].

Through a comprehensive understanding of the 
pathophysiology, risk factors, and clinical course of NRDS, as 
well as the latest evidence-based interventions and emerging 
therapies, healthcare providers can enhance their ability to 
deliver personalized and effective care to preterm infants 
with NRDS. This review will address key issues in NRDS 
management, identify areas for future research, and ultimately 
contribute to improving the prognosis and quality of life of 
affected neonates and their families [4].

Risk factor
Prematurity: Premature infants, particularly those born before 
37 weeks of gestation, are at the highest risk of developing 
NRDS due to insufficient surfactant production in immature 
lungs [5].

Maternal Factors: Certain maternal factors contribute to 
an increased risk of NRDS in neonates, including maternal 

diabetes, hypertension, preeclampsia, and intrauterine growth 
restriction [6].

Antenatal Corticosteroid Use: Lack of exposure to antenatal 
corticosteroids, which promote fetal lung maturation, 
increases the risk of NRDS in preterm infants [7].

Multiple Gestation: Twins, triplets, and other multiples are at 
an elevated risk of NRDS due to the increased likelihood of 
preterm birth and associated lung immaturity [8].

Male Gender: Male infants have a slightly higher incidence of 
NRDS compared to females, although the exact mechanism 
underlying this gender difference is not fully understood [9].

Maternal Substance Use: Maternal smoking, alcohol 
consumption, and illicit drug use during pregnancy are 
associated with an increased risk of preterm birth and NRDS 
in neonates [10].

Conclusion
Neonatal respiratory distress syndrome (NRDS) remains a 
significant challenge in the care of preterm infants, despite 
advances in neonatal medicine. This complex condition 
requires a multifaceted approach to management, addressing 
both the underlying pathophysiology and the associated 
complications. Throughout this review, we have explored the 
current challenges faced in the management of NRDS and 
highlighted recent advances in therapeutic strategies.
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