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Editorial

Conference Announcement on Sports medicine 2021

We are pleased to welcome you to the “ International 
Conference on Sports Medicine, Physical Rehabilitation 
& Physiotherapy” after the successful completion of the 
series of Sports Medicine Congress. The Conference is 
scheduled on March 15-16, 2021 at London, Uk London 
time zone. This Sports medicine 2021 Conference will 
provide you with an exemplary research experience and 
huge ideas.

The perspective of the Sports medicine conference is to 
set up technology research to help people understand 
how Technology techniques have advanced and how the 
field has developed in recent years.

Sports Medicine bridges the gap between science and 
practice in the promotion of exercise and health, and 
in the scientific assessment, study and understanding 
of sports performance. Regular features include: sports 
injury prevention and treatment; exercise for health; 
drugs in sport and recommendations for training and 
nutrition. Designed as a superb reference source for 
physicians, sports medicine specialists, physiotherapists, 
exercise physiologists, team doctors and trainers alike, 
Sports Medicine focuses on definitive and comprehen-
sive review articles that interpret and evaluate the current 
literature to provide the rationale for, and application of, 
research findings.

Sports medication can allude to the particular clinical 
forte or subspecialty of Sports Medicines. Game and Ex-
ercise Medicine , which is presently settled in numerous 
nations. It can extensively likewise allude to specialists 
and other paramedical professionals who work in a more 
wide setting. The different games medication specialists 
regularly cooperate as a group to guarantee the best re-
cuperation plan for the person. Colleagues can incorpo-
rate muscular specialists, affirmed athletic coaches, sports 
physical advisors, physical medication and restoration au-
thorities, just as strength SEM doctors.

Sports Medicine Gaining practical experience in the 
treatment of competitors and other truly dynamic peo-
ple, sports and exercise medication doctors have broad 
instruction in musculoskeletal medication. SEM special-
ists treat wounds, for example, muscle, tendon, ligament 
and bone issues, however may likewise treat on going dis-
eases that can influence physical execution, for example, 

asthma and diabetes. SEM specialists additionally prompt 
on overseeing and forestalling wounds. SEM specialists 
likewise convey clinical physical action intercessions, re-
futing the weight of infection legitimately inferable from 
physical inertia and the convincing proof for the adequa-
cy of activity in the essential, optional and tertiary avoid-
ance of sickness.

Global Sports Medicine Market was valued at $6,615 mil-
lion in 2016, and is expected to reach $11,172 million by 
2023, registering a CAGR of 7.7% from 2017 to 2023. 
Sports medicine is a branch of healthcare that deals with 
enhancing people’s athletic performance. Sport medicine 
products help people recover from injuries and prevent fu-
ture injuries. In addition, sports medicine has displayed a 
considerable growth among all the other healthcare fields, 
as professionals in this field have the capability to treat 
all kinds of people, and not just athletes. Increase in the 
demand for sports medicine is witnessed over the years 
owing to the rise in incidence of sports associated injuries 
along with increase in awareness among people regard-
ing physical fitness. In addition, government initiatives 
pertaining to sports medicine increase the participation 
of athletes worldwide. Further, elevation in the demand 
for minimally invasive surgeries supplements the market 
growth. However, lack of skilled professionals in this field, 
and inappropriate administration and guidelines regard-
ing sports medicine hamper the growth.

The sports medicine  industry is segmented based on 
product, application, and region. Based on product, it 
is classified into body reconstruction & repair products, 
body support & recovery products, body monitoring & 
evaluation, and accessories. Body reconstruction & repair 
products are sub-segmented into implants, arthroscopy 
devices, fracture and ligament repair devices, prosthetic 
devices, and ortho biologics. Further, body support & re-
covery products are sub-segmented into thermal therapy 
products, brace and support devices, and compression 
clothing. Body monitoring and evaluation is sub-segment-
ed into cardiac monitoring & evaluation, respiratory 
monitoring & evaluation, hemodynamic monitoring & 
evaluation, muscoskeletal monitoring & evaluation, and 
other monitoring & evaluation. Based on application, 
market is divided into knee injuries, shoulder injuries, 
ankle & foot injuries, elbow & wrist injuries, hip & groin 
injuries, back & spine injuries, and other injuries.


